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Hakuna Matata- Unleashing Your True Roar 

 

 
On August 30, 2024, Sat Paul Mittal School hosted a mesmerizing Form Assembly by the 
talented students of Class III, who brought the African Savanna to life in a captivating 
performance inspired by “The Lion King”. The event, held in the Mittal Auditorium, embodied 
the empowering theme "Hakuna Matata- Unleashing Your True Roar," and showcased the 
students' incredible talents through a series of performances that celebrated courage, 
friendship, and the journey of self-discovery. 
The assembly commenced with a warm welcome to the esteemed guests, including our 
worthy Principal, Ms. Bhupinder Gogia, who graced the occasion with her presence. The event 
began with the ceremonial lighting of the lamp, a moment of reverence accompanied by the 
chanting of Ved Mantras, setting a serene and auspicious tone for the morning. 
Following this, the stage came alive with a vibrant dance performance to "Circle of Life," 
beautifully choreographed to encapsulate the essence of the story’s beginning. As the echoes 
of the dance faded, a melodious rendition of "Oh! I just can’t wait to be the king" filled the 
auditorium. The joyful voices and spirited performance of Satyans brought smiles to every 
face in the audience, lightening the mood with the carefree anthem of the Savanna. Further, 
the young Satyans skilfully brought Simba’s journey to life, from his carefree days as a cub to 
his rise as the rightful king of the Pride Lands. Between acts, the students delivered a soulful 
performance of "Hakuna Matata," their voices harmonizing beautifully to convey the depth 
of the story’s emotional core. The alternating rhythm of drama and song kept the audience 
engaged and emotionally invested in the tale unfolding before them. At the end, the assembly 
reached its peak with an amazing grand finale dance performance by the students, set to fast, 
and energetic beats, leaving the audience in awe of the talent and teamwork displayed by the 
young performers. 
Ms. Bhupinder Gogia, Principal, Sat Paul Mittal School, addressed the gathering, expressing 
her pride in the students and the importance of nurturing such talent and confidence from a 
young age. She highlighted how the theme "Unleashing Your True Roar" was beautifully 
depicted by each participant, showcasing their inner strength and potential. From the 
mesmerizing "Circle of Life" dance to the dramatic enactment of Simba's journey, the young 
performers demonstrated that within each of them lies a unique strength waiting to be 
unleashed. 
The assembly concluded with a heartfelt Vote of Thanks, acknowledging the efforts of all 
Satyans, the parents and staff involved in making the event a roaring success. It was more 
than just a school assembly - it was a celebration of the creativity, passion, and boundless 
potential within each child, a true testament to the spirit of Sat Paul Mittal School. 


